
Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh  Opening Date: 02/28/22

Description Qty UOM  Unit 
Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit 

Price  Extended Price  Unit 
Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price 

1 DISTRICT 3 ARMORCOAT JCT HWY
9 & 35 ON WEST SIDE OF 9 650 TN  $     27.17  $       17,660.50 

2 DISTRICT 3 ARMORCOAT HWY 51
MILE POST . 23.6 ON NORTH SIDE 1000 TN  $     28.84  $       28,840.00 

3 DISTRICT 3 SURFACING HWY 20
MILE POST. 414 ON SOUTH SIDE 1260 TN  $     26.05  $       32,823.00 

4 DISTRICT 3 SURFACING HWY 110
MILE POST 1.28 800 TN  $     28.07  $       22,456.00 

5 DISTRICT 3 SURFACING HWY 77
MILE POST 167 830 TN  $     28.84  $       23,937.20 

6 DISTRICT 3 SURFACING HWY 20
MILE POST 414 ON SOUTH SIDE 190 TN  $     26.05  $         4,949.50 

7 DISTRICT 4 ARMORCOAT HWY 2 
MILE POST 328.41 NORTH SIDE 1000 TN  $     21.49  $       21,490.00  $     21.78  $       21,780.00  $ 19.00 Tn  $     19,000.000 

8 DISTRICT 4 ARMORCOAT I-80
MILE POST 292 S.E. CORNER 500 TN  $     18.52  $         9,260.00  $     20.00  $       10,000.00  $     23.00  $       11,500.00 

9 DISTRICT 4 WINDROW HWY 58
MILE POST. 29.18 800 TN  $     21.49  $       17,192.00  $     14.65  $       11,720.00  $13.15 Tn  $     10,520.000 

10 DISTRICT 4 WINDROW HWY 92
MILE POST 320.15 800 TN  $     22.23  $       17,784.00  $     14.15  $       11,320.00  $13.50 Tn  $     10,800.000 

11 DISTRICT 4 DEICEING FULLERTON
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     18.10  $         4,525.00  $17.00 Tn  $       4,250.000 

12 DISTRICT 4 DEICEING ORD
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     13.00  $         3,250.00  $12.75 Tn  $       3,187.500 

13 DISTRICT 4 DEICEING GREELEY
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     15.37  $         3,842.50  $     14.35  $         3,587.50  $14.00 Tn  $       3,500.000 

14 DISTRICT 4 DEICEING LOUP CITY
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     23.71  $         5,927.50  $     13.85  $         3,462.50  $13.25 Tn  $       3,312.500 

15 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 20
MILE POST 56 2000 TN  $     32.50  $       65,000.00 

16 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 20
MILE POST 65 2500 TN  $     33.00  $       82,500.00 

17 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 71
MILE POST 110 2000 TN  $     35.25  $       70,500.00 

18 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 250
MILE POST 11 2000 TN  $     34.65  $       69,300.00 

19 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 20
MILE POST 107 2000 TN  $     33.50  $       67,000.00 

20 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 250
MILE POST 1 2500 TN  $     33.25  $       83,125.00  $ 34.40  $     86,000.000 

21 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 250
MILE POST 113 1000 TN  $     33.25  $       33,250.00 

22 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 88
MILE POST 18 6000 TN  $     31.00  $     186,000.00  $ 23.00  $   138,000.000  $ 25.05  $   150,300.000 

23 DISTRICT 5 ARMORCOAT HWY 26/92MILE POST 
49 3000 TN  $     32.00  $       96,000.00  $ 26.75  $     80,250.000  $ 25.35  $     76,050.000 

24 DISTRICT 5 DEICEING
CHAPPELL YARD 2000 TN  $     20.95  $       41,900.00  $     16.22  $       32,440.00  $ 17.75  $     35,500.000  $ 15.35  $     30,700.000 

25 DISTRICT 5 DEICEING
KIMBALL YARD 2000 TN  $     20.95  $       41,900.00  $ 16.00  $     32,000.000  $ 17.70  $     35,400.000 

26 DISTRICT 5 DEICEING
HWY 30 MILE POST 55 2000 TN  $     20.95  $       41,900.00  $ 25.00  $     50,000.000  $ 19.10  $     38,200.000 

27 DISTRICT 5 DEICEING
HWY 27 MILE POST 220 1500 TN  $     27.50  $       41,250.00 

28 DISTRICT 6 ARMORCOAT HWY 2
MILE POST 183 2500 TN  $     22.25  $       55,625.00  $     19.00  $       47,500.00  $     26.40  $       66,000.00 

29 DISTRICT 6 ARMORCOAT HWY 92
MILE POST 205 2000 TN  $     23.75  $       47,500.00  $     27.00  $       54,000.00 

30 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 25
MILE POST 103 1000 TN  $     12.35  $       12,350.00  $     10.88  $       10,880.00  $ 15.00  $     15,000.000  $ 21.30  $     21,300.000 

31 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 23
MILE POST 57 2000 TN  $     15.75  $       31,500.00  $     12.42  $       24,840.00  $ 18.70  $     37,400.000 

32 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 97
MILE POST 9 1500 TN  $     13.00  $       19,500.00  $     12.05  $       18,075.00  $ 18.70  $     28,050.000 

33 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 183
MILE POST 89 660 TN  $     15.25  $       10,065.00  $     12.05  $         7,953.00  $     13.62  $         8,989.20  $13.50 Tn  $       8,910.000 

34 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 92
MILE POST 205 1400 TN  $     15.55  $       21,770.00  $     15.79  $       22,106.00  $ 22.75  $     31,850.000 

35 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 83
MILE POST 130 1000 TN  $     18.00  $       18,000.00  $     17.00  $       17,000.00  $     17.63  $       17,630.00 

36 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 92
MILE POST 225 1000 TN  $     15.95  $       15,950.00  $     15.44  $       15,440.00 

37 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 61
MILE POST 126 1000 TN  $     20.00  $       20,000.00  $     15.59  $       15,590.00  $ 17.50  $     17,500.000  $ 18.25  $     18,250.000 

38 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 92
MILE POST 175 1000 TN  $     20.25  $       20,250.00  $     17.18  $       17,180.00  $ 20.00  $     20,000.000  $ 19.45  $     19,450.000 

39 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 2
MILE POST 183 1500 TN  $     21.50  $       32,250.00  $     17.00  $       25,500.00  $     21.30  $       31,950.00  $ 27.80  $     41,700.000 

40 DISTRICT 6 WINDROW HWY 2
MILE POST 176 1000 TN  $     22.00  $       22,000.00  $     19.00  $       19,000.00  $     22.30  $       22,300.00  $ 27.80  $     27,800.000 

41 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING NORTH
PLATTE YARD HWY 30 & BUFF BILL 500 TN  $     11.50  $         5,750.00  $     12.08  $         6,040.00 

42 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING STAPLETON
MAINT YARD 500 TN  $     14.95  $         7,475.00  $     18.00  $         9,000.00  $     15.30  $         7,650.00 

43 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING MULLEN
MAINT YARD 500 TN  $     24.00  $       12,000.00  $     17.00  $         8,500.00  $     23.40  $       11,700.00 

44 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING WALLACE
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     16.00  $         4,000.00  $     16.20  $         4,050.00  $ 21.40  $       5,350.000 

45 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING OGALLALA
MAINT YARD 500 TN  $     16.00  $         8,000.00  $     11.20  $         5,600.00  $ 17.50  $       8,750.000 

 Simon  Ulrich Gravel Inc Emme Sand & Gravel Inc Jeffres Sand and Gravel Inc  L & L Gravel  Overton Sand & Gravel Co.  Paulsen Inc  Pine Bluffs Gravel & 
Excavating, Inc. 
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 #
Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, And 

Surfacing Gravel
 Atkinson Sand & Gravel 

Inc  D&L Sand & Gravel LLC  Ed Broadfoot & Sons Sand 
& Gravel Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh  Opening Date: 02/28/22

46 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING BIGSPRINGS
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     20.75  $         5,187.50  $     13.50  $         3,375.00  $ 18.50  $       4,625.000 

47 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING LEXINGTON
MAINT YARD 500 TN  $     13.00  $         6,500.00  $     10.00  $         5,000.00  $     10.75  $         5,375.00 

48 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING GOTHENBERG
MAINT YARD 500 TN  $     10.00  $         5,000.00  $     10.75  $         5,375.00 

49 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING BROKEN BOW
MAINT YARD 500 TN  $     16.75  $         8,375.00  $     12.00  $         6,000.00  $     14.36  $         7,180.00  $14.81 Tn  $       7,405.000 

50 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING OCONTO
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     13.50  $         3,375.00  $     11.90  $         2,975.00  $     15.05  $         3,762.50 

51 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING ANSLEY
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     15.35  $         3,837.50  $     12.00  $         3,000.00  $     15.98  $         3,995.00  $13.50 Tn  $       3,375.000 

52 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING HYANNIS
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     27.95  $         6,987.50  $     19.00  $         4,750.00  $     24.30  $         6,075.00 

53 DISTRICT 6 DEICEING THEDFORD
MAINT YARD 250 TN  $     21.00  $         5,250.00  $     13.00  $         3,250.00  $     22.50  $         5,625.00 

54 DISTRICT 8 ARMORCOAT ATKINSON
SOUTH YARD 1500 TN  $   9.25  $       13,875.00  $       9.95  $       14,925.00  $     12.67  $       19,005.00  $     20.00  $       30,000.00 

55 DISTRICT 8 ARMORCOAT HWY 20
MILE POST 303 2500 TN  $   9.35  $       23,375.00  $     10.89  $       27,225.00  $     11.50  $       28,750.00  $     20.00  $       50,000.00 

56 DISTRICT 8 ARMORCOAT NORTH OF
SPENCER YARD 2500 TN  $ 11.50  $       28,750.00  $     16.50  $       41,250.00  $     12.50  $       31,250.00  $     22.00  $       55,000.00 

57 DISTRICT 8 ARMORCOAT NAPER
MAINT YARD 2500 TN  $ 11.50  $       28,750.00  $     12.65  $       31,625.00  $     16.25  $       40,625.00  $     19.00  $       47,500.00 

58 DISTRICT 8 ARMORCOAT BUTTE
MAINT YARD 2000 TN  $ 11.50  $       23,000.00  $     13.85  $       27,700.00  $     13.50  $       27,000.00  $     19.00  $       38,000.00 

59 DISTRICT 8 ARMORCOAT HWY 281
MILE POST 142 2000 TN  $     20.00  $       40,000.00  $     13.95  $       27,900.00  $     16.93  $       33,860.00  $20.00 Tn  $     40,000.000 

60 DISTRICT 8 ARMORCOAT JCT
.95/281 2000 TN  $     16.50  $       33,000.00  $     12.50  $       25,000.00  $     19.25  $       38,500.00 

61 DISTRICT 8 ARMORCOAT JCT
.83/16B SOUTH SIDE 1200 TN  $     23.25  $       27,900.00  $     19.80  $       23,760.00 

62 DISTRICT 8 WINDROW HWY 20
MILE POST 135 1200 TN  $     19.80  $       23,760.00  $     29.50  $       35,400.00  $     25.35  $       30,420.00 

63 DISTRICT 8 WINDROW HWY 20
MILE POST 165 600 TN  $     14.90  $         8,940.00  $     25.01  $       15,006.00  $     20.50  $       12,300.00 

64 DISTRICT 8 WINDROW HWY 12
MILE POST 19 600 TN  $ 16.25  $         9,750.00  $     16.40  $         9,840.00  $     18.81  $       11,286.00  $     16.75  $       10,050.00 

65 DISTRICT 8 WINDROW HWY 20
MILE POST 202 1200 TN  $     10.05  $       12,060.00  $     19.12  $       22,944.00  $     15.75  $       18,900.00 

66 DISTRICT 8 DEICEING ATKINSON
MAINT YARD 500 TN  $   7.85  $         3,925.00  $       8.45  $         4,225.00  $     10.05  $         5,025.00  $     14.00  $         7,000.00 

67 DISTRICT 8 DEICEING O'NEILLMAINT YARD 1500 TN  $   9.00  $       13,500.00  $     12.25  $       18,375.00  $       9.45  $       14,175.00  $     16.00  $       24,000.00 

68 DISTRICT 8 DEICEING NORTH OF
SPENCER YARD 1000 TN  $   9.85  $         9,850.00  $     15.10  $       15,100.00  $     10.50  $       10,500.00  $     16.50  $       16,500.00 

69 DISTRICT 8 DEICEING NAPER
MAINT YARD 500 TN  $ 11.00  $         5,500.00  $     10.65  $         5,325.00  $     13.75  $         6,875.00  $     14.25  $         7,125.00 

70 DISTRICT 8 DEICEING BURWELL
MAINT YARD 1000 TN  $     16.00  $       16,000.00  $     12.75  $       12,750.00  $13.25 Tn  $     13,250.000 

71 DISTRICT 8 DEICEING VALENTINE
MAINT YARD 2500 TN  $     10.62  $       26,550.00  $     17.68  $       44,200.00  $     15.00  $       37,500.00 

72 DISTRICT 8 DEICEING MERRIMAN
MAINT YARD 2500 TN  $     24.90  $       62,250.00  $     26.00  $       65,000.00  $     25.50  $       63,750.00 

73 OPTION 1:  DELIVERY COST/TN
ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200 TN  $   0.17  $              34.00  $0.15 ton 

mile  $              30.00  $0.20/ton 
mile  $              40.00  $0.15/ton 

mile  $              30.00  $0.15/ton 
mile  $              30.00  $       0.18  $              36.00  $0.20/ton 

mile  $              40.00  No Bid  

74 OPTION 2:  DELIVERY COST/TN
SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200 TN  $   0.17  $              34.00  $       0.15  $              30.00  $0.20/ton 

mile  $              40.00  $0.15/ton 
mile  $              30.00  $0.15/ton 

mile  $              30.00  $       0.18  $              36.00  $0.20/ton 
mile  $              40.00  No Bid  

75 OPTION 3:  DELIVERY COST/TN
WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200 TN  $   0.17  $              34.00  $       0.15  $              30.00  $0.20/ton 

mile  $              40.00  $0.15/ton 
mile  $              30.00  $0.15/ton 

mile  $              30.00  $       0.18  $              36.00  $0.20/ton 
mile  $              40.00  No Bid  

76 OPTION 4:  DELIVERY COST/TN
DEICEING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200 TN  $   0.17  $              34.00  $       0.15  $              30.00  $0.20/ton 

mile  $              40.00  $0.15/ton 
mile  $              30.00  $0.15/ton 

mile  $              30.00  $       0.18  $              36.00  $0.20/ton 
mile  $              40.00  No Bid  

 $     160,411.00  $     143,520.00  $       71,813.50  $     305,317.00  $     370,733.70  $  1,954,826.50  $     134,500.00  $       36,588.00  $     433,222.70  $     573,775.00  $     475,650.00  $     127,510.00 

As Required 3 30  Per ITB  As Needed 
COMMENTS

100% 30 Days 0%  N/A 
Delivery Days ARO 15 45 15

TOTAL
Payment Terms  Net 30  100% 30 Days  100% 30 Days 0% 60 Days Net 30


